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FR-19 PROTECTIVE FIREFIGHTING EQUIPMENT
AUGUST 18, 2016 @ 11:00AM

Verified: Johwuwyy Stieglitz August 18, 2016

Note: Rhinehart bid a two pack on the batteries at $4.75 each or $2.375 per battery

DGreen Indicates Low Bid
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QTY ITEM Anderson Fire & Safety Fireline, Inc. Rhinehart Safe Industries Wally's Fire & Safety
67 Boots $ 320.00] $ 21,440.00 No Bid No Bid $ 345.00 exception
67 Turnout Coat $  111280] $ 74,557.60 No Bid No Bid $ 1,235.00 exception
67 Turnout Pants | $ 855.02] $ 57,286.34 No Bid No Bid $ 915.00 exception
67 Flash Hood exception $ 42.00 $ 40.00 $ 3700 | $ 2479.00 exception
67 Gloves exception $ 69.00] $ 4,623.00 No Bid $ 75.00 exception
67 Helmets $ 284.00 $ 271.000 $  18,157.00 No Bid $ 272.00 exception
67 Helmet Front $ 39.00 $ 35.00]$  2,345.00 No Bid $ 39.00 $ 46.00
50 Wild Land Gear | $ 28400 $ 14,200.00 No Bid No Bid $ 285.00 exception
100 Batteries $ 1.65 $ 1.59 $ 2.38 $ 150 ] s 150.00 || $ 1.75
100 | Helmet Mounted
Flash Lights $ 98.00 $ 99.00 $ 116.00 $ 92.00 $ 91.00] $ 9,100.00
30 SCBA Mask $ 206.00 | $ 6,180.00 No Bid $ 228.00 No Bid No Bid
SUB-TOTAL $ 173,663.94 $ 25,125.00 $2,629.00 $ 9,100.00
8% SC Sales Tax $ 13,893.12 $ 2,010.00 $ 210.32 $ 728.00
TOTAL $ 187,557.06 $ 27,135.00 $ 2,839.32 $ 9,828.00
Verified: Kawe B. Syfrett August 18, 2016

Fire Equipment Bid



