



**BID: CPST-09
RECREATION COMPLEX RENOVATION & EXPANSION
JUNE 27, 2017 @ 2:00PM**

CONTRACTOR		BASE BID	Alternate - 1	Alternate - 2	Alternate - 3	Alternate - 4	Alternate - 5	Alternate - 6
1	Attaway Construction	\$3,709,000.00	\$3,491.00	\$800.00	\$850.00	\$800.00	\$5,400.00	\$9,800.00
2	EL Jackson Construction, Inc.	no bid	-	-	-	-	-	-
3	IPW Construction Group, LLC	no bid	-	-	-	-	-	-
4	PH Padgett Construction, LLC	no bid	-	-	-	-	-	-
LOCAL CONTRACTOR		BASE BID	Alternate - 1	Alternate - 2	Alternate - 3	Alternate - 4	Alternate - 5	Alternate - 6
1	IP Builders, Inc.	\$3,613,544.00	\$10,380.00	\$3,510.00	\$1,750.00	\$3,042.00	\$6,021.00	\$23,400.00
2	Mitchell Construction Co. Inc.	\$3,999,999.00	\$4,155.00	\$6,060.00	\$16,975.00	\$7,131.00	\$5,555.00	\$24,525.00
3	Wildwood Contractors, Inc.	no bid	-	-	-	-	-	-

Verified: *Kaye B. Syfrett*

Date: 6-27-2017

Verified: *Johnny Stieglitz*

Date: 6-27-2017